
Solitude is the new trend

A DOCUMENTARY by Channel 4 News last month movingly showed the suffering that
loneliness  causes to millions of elderly people.

Margaret Nickless attempted, with tears in her eyes, to describe her plight in the
words, “If you have never been lonely, you cannot   imagine what it is like”. Roy
Croucher described loneliness in the words, “You know that when you return to a
totally empty home, you know that loneliness will afflict you again. And you spend all
your days waiting for the phone to ring”.  

The number of people living alone across the world is approaching 300 million. That
figure is also growing by the year. The rapid rise in the number of people who live
alone or feel lonely, particularly in Western societies, is attracting considerable
interest among scientists and is the subject of much research.

As in so many areas, America tops the list. More than 32 million people in the country
live alone; 28 per cent of households consist of only one person. Eric Klinenberg, a
professor of sociology from New York University, approaches the subject differently
and suggests that solitude is a new “trend”. The world of brand names and



consumerism have certainly made solitude a trend. Products aimed at people who live
alone are extraordinarily popular across the world. World-famous brands concentrate
on products aimed at single people.

In short, people who live alone are regarded as a significant “economic market”. The
reason for this is that the majority of people who live alone generally tend to lead
active lives; they frequently dine out and participate more often in activities such as
going to concerts, the theatre and cinema and they make more use of sports centres.

Therefore, instead of measures to prevent solitude, people are literally being
encouraged to adopt it. And, of course, that leads to a serious increase in the
numbers of people living alone.

Another surprising thing is that the great majority of people now live alone out of
choice, not because they have to.

Klinenberg attributes this to people now having the purchasing power to meet their
needs entirely by themselves. To put it another way, he is saying that as people’s
economic means grow, so does their potential for living alone.

The reason why young people prefer to live alone, according to Klinenberg, is their
search for an identity.

Another factor associated with the increase in the number of people living alone is
technology. The fact that people are in constant contact thanks to the Internet and
social media is another important factor in the rise of people living alone.

Yet, neither advances in technology or communications or transportation are in fact
responsible for so many people living alone. There is but one reason for this problem
that is growing by the day; the lovelessness that is afflicting the world. The lack of
love in the world is the only reason why young and old choose, or are condemned, to
live in solitude.

People do not love one another. They disregard and take no interest in one another;
elderly people find themselves abandoned, with nobody feeling the slightest pang of
conscience. A blind eye is turned to their living isolated from the world.

Young people, who receive no interest or love from the people around them, are
encouraged to take up habits that will end up harming them. People who become
tired of friendlessness and lovelessness seek the company of dogs, cats, budgies, cats
and tropical fish instead.

People who fail to find the love they seek lose all the joy of living and decide to live
alone. The list could be extended in even greater detail.

The fact is that lovelessness is one of the greatest societal scourges. Solitude is the
most dangerous sickness caused by lovelessness and one of the greatest causes of
suffering. Indeed, international law has determined that isolation is the worst
punishment for criminal offences.

Criminals are condemned to isolation in prison because of their crimes. The longer the
sentence, the worse the punishment. Life imprisonment, in one sense, means a life of
solitude.



Contrary to what many academic studies suggest, solitude is not a natural part of life.
Being together in a spirit of love and friendship and brotherhood, as the old saying
goes, is the spice of life. It is inhuman to choose a life devoid of love and friendship or
to impose such a life on others.

Human beings are created to wish to see beauty around them and to delight in it. A
joyous faith in the heart and love of God gives rise to a profound love for the
manifestations of Him. The soul can only be at ease when it sees the manifestations
of God. Animals, plants, trees, fruits, foods and lovely views are all delightful
manifestations of the existence of God but the most intense manifestation of God is
human beings. The moral values, love and affection of God are most intensely
manifested in humanity.

Like many other problems in the world, loneliness can be eradicated if people live by
love. Everyone will then come together in a spirit of love and everyone, great or
small, will be loved and respected. Nobody will be condemned to a life of solitude or
even wish to live alone. They will spend their days in joy and happiness, as if every
day were a holiday. We all have a duty to make those fine times a reality.
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